



VILLAGE OF MAMARONECK

123 MAMARONECK AVE
MAMARONECK, NY 10543
PHONE # (914) 777-7722 FAX # (914) 777-7787
Federal ID: 13-6007303

Check Number:
Fiscal Year/Period: 2020/12
Voucher Number: 55595853
Batch Number:
PO Number:
Pay Due: 05/11/2020
Check ID: 02091
Check Date:
Creation Date: 05/04/2020
Invoice Number: Multiple
Page: 1 of 1

Voucher

Vendor: 0000011221
LEVENTHAL, MULLANEY & BLINKOFF, LLP
15 REMSEN AVE
ROSLYN, NY 11576

CONTRACT # PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
FED ID/SS: 113-547627

Description: VILLAGE OF MAMARONECK ETHICS MATTER - PERIOD OF: FEBRUARY 1, 2020 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29, 2020 AND PERIOD OF:
MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2020

Invoice Numbers: APRIL 14, 2020; MARCH 19; MARCH 19-1 **Total** \$31,865.00

Date	Qty.	Unit	Description	Unit Price	Amount
			VILLAGE OF MAMARONECK ETHICS MATTER - PERIOD OF: FEBRUARY 1, 2020 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29, 2020 AND PERIOD OF: MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2020		31,865.00
			A.1420.0421 (GENERAL FUND LAW CONTRACT SERVICES)		
			Total:		\$31,865.00

Ordered By: CWONG Approved By:

LEVENTHAL, MULLANEY & BLINKOFF, LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
15 REMSEN AVENUE
ROSLYN, NEW YORK 11576
TELEPHONE: (516) 484-5440
FACSIMILE: (516) 484-2710

STEVEN G. LEVENTHAL
THOMAS J. MULLANEY
JEFFREY L. BLINKOFF

March 19, 2020

Cindy Goldstein, CPA, Esq.
5 Oak Lane
Larchmont, NY 10538

For Professional Services Rendered
Period of: February 1, 2020 through February 29, 2020
Re: Village of Mamaroneck Ethics Matter

02/07/20 SGL Telephone conference with client; prepare letter to Mayor and Board Trustees	1.00
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------	------

Total hours 1.00 @ \$400.00 per hour	\$ 400.00
--------------------------------------	-----------

Disbursement:

Carol Vergara & Associates- expert witness	\$ 450.00
--------------------------------------------	-----------

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$ 850.00
-------------------------	------------------

LEVENTHAL, MULLANEY & BLINKOFF, LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
15 REMSEN AVENUE
ROSLYN, NEW YORK 11576
TELEPHONE: (516) 484-5440
FACSIMILE: (516) 484-2710

STEVEN G. LEVENTHAL
THOMAS J. MULLANEY
JEFFREY L. BLINKOFF

March 19, 2020

Cindy Goldstein, CPA, Esq.
5 Oak Lane
Larchmont, NY 10538

For Professional Services Rendered
Period of: February 1, 2020 through February 29, 2020
Re: Village of Mamaroneck Ethics Matter

02/15/20 TJM	Review decision and file documents; draft outline for Article 78 petition	1.00
02/17/20 TJM	Review file documents; research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition	3.50
02/18/20 TJM	Research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition; review transcripts of testimony	3.50
02/19/20 TJM	Research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition	1.50
02/20/20 TJM	Research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition	2.00
02/21/20 TJM	Research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition	3.00
02/24/20 TJM	Research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition; review transcript and file documents for record references	3.50
02/25/20 SGL	Review and revise memorandum in support of Article 78 petition	2.00
02/25/20 TJM	Research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition	3.00
02/26/20 SGL	Review and edit draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition; correspondence with client re same	2.00
02/26/20 TJM	Research and draft memorandum in support of Article 78 petition	3.00

02/27/20 TJM Review comments re brief; research relevant authorities 2.00

02/28/20 SGL Revise memorandum of law 2.00

Total hours 31.00 @ \$400.00 per hour \$ 12,400.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE \$ 12,400.00

LEVENTHAL, MULLANEY & BLINKOFF, LLP
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
15 REMSEN AVENUE
ROSLYN, NEW YORK 11576
TELEPHONE: (516) 484-5440
FACSIMILE: (516) 484-2710

STEVEN G. LEVENTHAL
THOMAS J. MULLANEY
JEFFREY L. BLINKOFF

April 14, 2020

Cindy Goldstein, CPA, Esq.
5 Oak Lane
Larchmont, NY 10538

For Professional Services Rendered

Period of: March 1, 2020 through March 31, 2020

Re: Village of Mamaroneck Ethics Matter

03/02/20 SGL	Revise memorandum of law in support of Article 78 petition; telephone conference with client re same	4.00
03/02/20 TJM	Review and revise memorandum in support of Article 78 proceeding; research relevant authorities	2.50
03/03/20 SGL	Revise memorandum of law; telephone conference with client re pending matter	3.00
03/03/20 TJM	Research and drafting of memorandum in support of Article 78	2.00
03/04/20 SGL	Continued drafting and revising to memorandum of law; telephone conference with client re pending matter	3.00
03/04/20 TJM	Research and revise memorandum in support of Article 78; draft petition and complaint	2.75
03/05/20 TJM	Review and revise memorandum in support of Article 78; draft petition and complaint	4.00
03/06/20 TJM	Revise memorandum in support of Article 78; continued drafting of petition and complaint; draft summons, notice and affirmation	4.00
03/12/20 SGL	Revise to summons, complaint and memorandum of law	6.00

03/13/20	TJM	Research and continued drafting of Article 78 petition, complaint and related documents; review and prepare exhibits	4.00
03/14/20	SGL	Final revisions to memorandum of law; telephone conference with client re same	4.00
03/16/20	SGL	Finalize complaint, petition, memorandum of law, summons and notice and affirmation in support; telephone conference with client re same; file via NYSCEF	4.00
03/25/20	SGL	Prepare documents for service; attendance at Village Hall for service of process	2.00
03/26/20	TJM	Draft and execute affirmation of service	0.50

Total hours 45.75 @ \$400.00 per hour **\$ 18,300.00**

Disbursements:

Westchester County Supreme Court- filing fee **\$ 315.00**

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE **\$ 18,615.00**